
Labour Group Amendment to Independent Motion
Full Council 22nd July 2021
Financial Recovery

Original Motion

This Council acknowledges:

 That Slough Borough Council is in an exceptional financial crisis and notes the Secretary of 
State’s comments regarding the “poor leadership” which led us to this point, and

Resolves to: 

Request that the Council’s Investigating and Disciplinary Committee consider the capability of the 
Chief Executive of the Council to lead us to financial recovery.

Labour Group Amendment 

This Council acknowledges:

 That Slough Borough Council is in an exceptional financial crisis and notes the Secretary of 
State’s comments. regarding the “poor leadership” which led us to this point, and  

This Council Rresolves to: 

 Request that the Council’s Investigating and Disciplinary Committee consider the capability 
of the Chief Executive of the Council to lead us to financial recovery.

 Work to lead financial recovery, supporting the Council Leader and Cabinet who will set out 
revised expectations of the Chief Executive and Executive Board to deliver at pace the 
changes required to put this Council on a sound financial footing.

 Receive at September Full Council a plan including key milestones to achieve financial 
recovery and specific expectations for individual directorates. These will be regularly 
monitored through appropriate Lead Member(s) meeting with their executive directors and 
contributing to the performance management of senior officers through our new Objectives 
and Key Results performance management framework (which have been recently agreed via 
the Transformation Programme).

Substantive Labour Group Motion 

This Council acknowledges:

 That Slough Borough Council is in an exceptional financial crisis and notes the Secretary of 
State’s comments.

This Council resolves to: 

 Work to lead financial recovery, supporting the Council Leader and Cabinet who will set out 
revised expectations of the Chief Executive and Executive Board to deliver at pace the 
changes required to put this Council on a sound financial footing.



 Receive at September Full Council a plan including key milestones to achieve financial 
recovery and specific expectations for individual directorates. These will be regularly 
monitored through appropriate Lead Member(s) meeting with their executive directors and 
contributing to the performance management of senior officers through our new Objectives 
and Key Results performance management framework (which have been recently agreed via 
the Transformation Programme).

Proposed by Cllr Carter

Seconded by Cllr Minhas


